
2016 Seasonal Bids 

 Bituminous and Asphalt Materials 

 Steel Culverts 

 Cutting Edges 

 Road Salt 

 Pavement Striping 

 Gravel Materials 

 Equipment Rental 

 Weed Spraying 

 Calcium Chloride Dust Control 



Seasonal Requirements:  Bituminous and Asphalt Materials

Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

Approx.

Item No. Description                              Quantity Unit

-- Bituminous Patching 900   Ton No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3151 Bituminous Material CSS-1HD50

Picked up by County Truck 200 Ton $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $495.00 No Bid

Delivered to Jobsite 200 Ton $255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $578.00 No Bid

3151 Bituminous Material CRS-2P

Picked up by County Truck 400 Ton $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $530.00 No Bid

Delivered to Jobsite 400 Ton $465.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $613.00 No Bid

2331.549 Bituminous Mixture Production 4,000   Ton No Bid $106.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Mix (Patch Material)

2331.549 Bituminous Mixture Production 4,000   Ton No Bid $69.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hot Mix (Patch Material)

-- 3723 Crack Sealing Material 20,000   Ton No Bid No Bid

(or equivalent)

***  Accepted bid of Flint Hills Resources for Bituminous Material

***  Accepted bid of McLaughlin & Schulz for Bituminous Patching  as locations warrant

***  Accepted bid of McLaughlin & Schulz for Bituminous Mixture Production  as locations warrant

***  Maintenance Foreman will determine qty and source of Crack Sealing Material  needed during 2016, incl. compatibility with our equipment.

January 21, 2016

Flint Hills

Resources

McLaughlin & 

Schulz, Inc.

Konrad

Mat'l Sales

Brock White

Company

Midstates

Equipment

$0.470/lb 
RightPointe 3405, 3723 in box

$0.520/lb
RightPointe 3405, 3723 no box

Vance

Brothers

$0.471/lb 
Deery 3723

$0.580/lb $0.700/lb 



Seasonal Bids: Corrugated Steel Culverts
Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

    Item            Unit

 8"  Culvert LinFt 6.78 n/a 4.50

 8"  Apron Each 61.95 n/a 50.00

 8"  Band Each 10.25 n/a 5.63

10"  Culvert LinFt 7.20 n/a 5.25

10"  Apron Each 64.05 n/a 52.00

10"  Band Each 10.80 n/a 6.57

12"  Culvert LinFt 6.95 6.85 7.92

12"  Apron Each 39.35 37.50 35.00

12"  Band Each 10.52 10.40 9.90

15"  Culvert LinFt 8.65 8.70 9.74

15"  Apron Each 49.95 43.50 43.56

15"  Band Each 12.98 13.10 12.18

18"  Culvert LinFt 10.29 10.25 11.56

18"  Apron Each 64.75 45.75 56.00

18"  Band Each 15.44 15.40 14.45

24"  Culvert LinFt 13.49 13.75 15.38

24"  Apron Each 96.65 68.13 84.00

24"  Band Each 20.24 20.40 19.23

30"  Culvert LinFt 20.87 21.25 23.61

30"  Apron Each 163.05 161.50 151.00

30"  Band Each 31.30 26.27 29.52

36"  Culvert LinFt 24.98 25.25 28.17

36"  Apron Each 276.75 242.63 244.00

36"  Band Each 37.47 31.77 35.21

42"  Culvert LinFt 40.71 41.25 45.90

42"  Apron Each 495.65 444.97 502.00

42"  Band Each 61.07 59.40 57.38

48"  Culvert LinFt 46.40 47.15 52.23

48"  Apron Each 576.85 517.84 584.00

48"  Band Each 69.60 69.40 65.29

***

January 21, 2016

Contech Eng. Solutions

West Chester, OH

Accepted all bids.  Should a need arise for an order of culverts, bands, and aprons, 

we will apply the above prices to our order and determine the lowest total amount for 

that order, placing our order with that company.

Metal Culverts, Inc.

Albert Lea, MN

True North Steel

St. Paul, MN



Seasonal Requirements:   Cutting Edges, Moldboards, Bolts

Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

January 21, 2016

Cutting Edges

Item                     Model        Part #

 H & L

Mesabi Ziegler, Inc.

Titan

Machinery

Kris

Engineering

Winter

Equipment

B & F

Fastener

Falls V-Plow V-90 945-600 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Falls V-Plow V-90 Nose 59-24 72.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Falls Wing W-12 202.45 No Bid No Bid 129.03 162.36 No Bid 

Falls One-Way 312-H 202.45 No Bid No Bid 129.03 162.36 No Bid 

Falls Runners 312 1" x 8" x 18" 180.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Wausau HD-12 70-16-8 168.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Wausau Runners V-90-88 73-124 243.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Wausau Runners B31-58W 73-179-2 254.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

SnoGo Edge MP3D 86-22 223.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

SnoGo Runners MP3D 2-7R,L 135.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Case Loader 4 CuYd L125171 352.86 No Bid 448.00 313.34 No Bid No Bid 

Case Loader 4 CuYd L125172 276.73 No Bid 369.00 236.51 No Bid No Bid 

Cat. Loader 950H 4¼ yd GP Center 1399230 323.33 300.48 288.91 283.96 No Bid No Bid 

Cat. Loader 950H 4¼ yd GP End 4T8101 92.14 99.37 94.17 85.19 No Bid No Bid 

Moldboard Edges

Size                               Part #

 H & L

Mesabi Ziegler, Inc.

Titan

Machinery

Kris

Engineering

Winter

Equipment

B & F

Fastener

3/4" x 8" x 4'  (⅝" hole) 445-400 65.85 64.78 65.84 55.26 76.24 No Bid 

3/4" x 8" x 6'  (⅝" hole) 1645-609 98.77 93.59 96.31 80.86 114.33 No Bid 

3/4" x 8" x 8'  (⅝" hole) 1645-809 131.68 122.38 128.42 106.50 152.43 No Bid 

3/4" x 8" x 4'  (¾" hole) 65.85 64.79 66.07 55.26 76.24 No Bid 

3/4" x 8" x 6'  (¾" hole) 98.77 93.59 96.31 80.86 114.33 No Bid 

3/4" x 8" x 8'  (¾" hole) 131.68 122.38 114.04 106.50 152.43 No Bid 

Carbide  3/4" x 6" x 36" 6648-30100 151.47 147.37 143.15 137.94 186.00 No Bid 

Carbide  3/4" x 6" x 48" 6648-40100 201.96 188.90 190.88 183.93 248.00 No Bid 

Scarifier Blades

Size and Type                               

 H & L

Mesabi Ziegler, Inc.

Titan

Machinery

Kris

Engineering

Winter

Equipment

B & F

Fastener
14' Pacal 2000 - $3,259.82 14',⅝" hole - $3,231.56 No Bid Sandvik 2000 3 ft - $636.36 No Bid No Bid 

16' Pacal 2000 - $3,725.76 16',⅝" hole - $3,693.22 Sandvik 2000 4 ft - $848.48

14', ¾" hole - $3,231.56

Plow Bolts and Nuts 16', ¾" hole - $3,693.22

Size                               

 H & L

Mesabi Ziegler, Inc.

Titan

Machinery

Kris

Engineering

Winter

Equipment

B & F

Fastener

⅝" x 2"        Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 103.00 160.00 92.00 No Bid No Bid 69.95

⅝" x 2¼"     Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 109.00 161.00 92.00 No Bid 200.00 77.72

⅝" x 3"        Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 133.00 176.00 123.00 No Bid 221.00 92.38

⅝" x 3½"     Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 148.00 185.00 148.00 No Bid 252.00 108.78

¾" x 2"        Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 145.00 218.00 115.00 No Bid No Bid 129.04

¾" x 2¼"     Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 160.00 228.00 130.00 No Bid No Bid 102.41

¾" x 3"        Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 191.00 269.00 153.00 No Bid No Bid 127.00

¾" x 3½"     Grade 8 Price/100 (incl nuts) 213.00 298.00 173.00 No Bid No Bid 164.61

***  Any orders will be based on the above prices.

      Award of order going to firm with lowest total bid for that order.

Submitted price quotes contain additional details relating to specific bid items, quantity discounts, shipping charges,

and the time period during which the prices for all of these items are valid.

⅝" x 8" x 12 ft (use ⅝" bolt) 

⅝" x 8" x 12 ft (use ⅝" bolt) 

See price quote for

 Razor System option



Seasonal Requirements:  Road Salt

Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

Johnson Feed Cargill, Inc. Central Salt, LLC Compass Minerals America Morton Salt, Inc.

Canton, SD North Olmsted, OH Elgin, IL Overland Park, KS Chicago, IL

Price Per Ton

F.O.B. Granite Falls $91.00 $91.65 $91.68 $95.00 $98.55

**  Accepted low bid of Johnson Feed, Inc. for salt delivered to Granite Falls

January 21, 2016



Seasonal Requirements:  Pavement Striping

Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

January 21, 2016

Approximate

Item Description                    Quantity   Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount

Highway Striping - Yellow Paint 800 Gal 12.40 9,920.00 12.50 10,000.00 13.11 10,488.00

Highway Striping - White Paint 2300 Gal 12.25 28,175.00 12.60 28,980.00 13.42 30,866.00

$38,095.00 $38,980.00 $41,354.00

***   Accepted low bid of Sir Lines-A-Lot

AAA Striping Service 

St. Michael, MN

Sir Lines-A-Lot

Minneapolis, MN

Traffic Marking Service

Maple Lake,  MN 



Seasonal Requirements:  Gravel Stockpile, Gravel Wearing Course Inplace, Riprap, Sand, Etc.

Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

 Approx.

Item No. Description                               Quantity Unit

2123 Gravel Hauled and Spread 150,000  Ton·Mi No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.85

on Various County Roads

3138 Gravel Stockpile in Pit, Class 1 15,000  Ton No Bid $5.95 No Bid No Bid $6.75

County Trucks Loaded by County

3138 Gravel Stockpile in Pit, Class 1 15,000  Ton No Bid $6.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

County Trucks Loaded by Bidder

3138 Gravel Stockpile in Pit, Class 5 15,000  Ton $4.60 $5.60 $7.75 No Bid No Bid

County Trucks Loaded by County

3138 Gravel Stockpile in Pit, Class 5 15,000  Ton No Bid $5.95 $7.75 No Bid No Bid

County Trucks Loaded by Bidder

3127 FA-2 Sealcoat Aggregate in Pit 1,500  Ton No Bid $11.00 $18.60 No Bid No Bid

3127 FA-3 Sealcoat Aggregate in Pit 1,500  Ton No Bid $11.00 $16.50 No Bid No Bid

2511 Random Riprap in Pit, Class III 300  Ton No Bid $13.00 $17.50 No Bid No Bid

3149 Pit Run Material for Fill 700  Ton $2.20 $2.00 No Bid $1.43 $2.00

3149 Sand (For Salt/Sand Mix) 1,500  Ton No Bid $6.30 No Bid $1.43 $5.20

County Trucks Loaded by County

3149 Sand (For Salt/Sand Mix) 1,500  Ton No Bid $6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

County Trucks Loaded by Bidder

-- Gravel Pit Use 45,000  Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.43 No Bid

(County to crush Class 5 gravel)

***  For uniformity of bids, all price quotes were converted to a weight basis, using 1.4 tons = 1 cubic yard

***  All price quotes for materials accepted, as needed.

Henry O. 

Olson,Sr

Commerford

Gravel

$6.75/ton

½" unwashed sandOther

Martin Marietta 

Materials

January 21, 2016

Weber

Gravel Pit

Jay Schoep

80
th

St Aggregates



Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

Baker Bros. Construction Jeseritz Construction Kockelman Construction S K Contracting K & K Tiling Barker Excavating Stoks Enterprises

Granite Falls Cottonwood Canby Montevideo Clarkfield Hanley Falls Canby

           Item          Description and Size Size/Make Hourly Rate Size/Make Hourly Rate Size/Make Hourly Rate Size/Make Hourly Rate Size/Make Hourly Rate Size/Make Hourly Rate Size/Make Hourly Rate

Tractor Loader 4 CuYd, 4WD Rubber Tired

3 CuYd, 4WD Rubber Tired FR130 & WA250 110.00 3¼ Yd JD624 145.00

2 CuYd, 4WD Rubber Tired 580 Case 90.00

Track Type Loader (2-3 CuYd) 955 Cat 135.00

Komatsu PC160 125.00 Excavators

Backhoe 2 1/2 CuYd Crawler 200LC Hitachi 140.00 Komatsu PC200 135.00 Komatsu PC200 175.00 JD 120C Excav. 120.00 235C Cat 185.00 3 yd Cat 330CL 180.00

2WD Tractor-Loader 510 John Deere 105.00 Case 580 TLB ext. 100.00 Case 580C 125.00 Hyundai 290 LC3 170.00

4WD Excavator 290LC3 long reach 195.00

Truck Mounted Hyundai 140 LC7 135.00

Shouldering Machine Self Propelled

Crane Mobile, Rubber Tired AM 4450 (45 ton) 185.00

Pile Driver, Equipment/Crew

Crawler with Dragline

Ford 9000 10 yd 113.00

Trucks Tandem Dump Truck 12 yd Int'l 95.00 12 yd Int'l tandem 85.00 Int'l 9300 10 yd 113.00 Tri-Axle '93 Mack 90.00 Ford L9000 65.00

Single Axle Dump Truck 15 yd Int'l tri axle 95.00 Int'l 9400 12 yd 113.00

Truck with Belly Dump Trailer 20 yd side dump 100.00

Truck & Lowboy Trailer 50 ton Talbert 110.00 Intl9400 50T DGN 134.00 '99 Mack,Quad 50T 145.00

Tractor for Tanker,BellyDump,Flatbed

Belly Dump for Hauling Gravel Base

Flatbed for Moving Equipment 25 ton tri-ax 90.00

Motor Grader Model/Size (Blading Only) FiatAllis FG65 75.00 JD770A 103.00 JD 770CH 107.00

Model/Size with V-Plow & Wing JD770A 118.00 JD 772CH 127.00

Dozer Rubber Tired

Crawler/Pushcat D6 Cat 145.00 Komatsu D65EX12 135.00 D5C / D8H JD 650J LGP 120.00 Cat D6D LGP 130.00 D6R Cat 150.00

Other Dozer Komatsu D51 LGP 115.00 8230B/8220B Dresser TD9H 95.00

Scraper 2 Engine TS14 20 yd 175.00

1 Engine JD 570Hp, 20yd 175.00

Other Cat D8 & 80 Pull 155.00

Packers Sheepfoot & Tractor self-propelled 66" 80.00 60" DD/440 Allis 118.00

Farm Tractor 48" DD/1370 Case 108.00 48"DD 230HP 55.00

Vibratory Pull Type

Rubber-Tire Roller 1370Case,13wheel 108.00

Self Propelled Vibratory 66" smooth drum 80.00 Wacker sheepsfoot 80.00 30" trench packer 60.00 54" DynaPac 50.00

Miscellaneous Bituminous Crackfilling Router

Bituminous Crackfilling Melter

Infrared Heater for Pavement Repairs

Tractor & Lowboy Trailer (25 Ton Minimum)

Transport County Snowblower

Hourly Rate (Includes Driver) Talbert 50 Ton 110.00 50 Ton 125.00 50T TrailKing 120.00

Hourly Rate (County Driver)

Other Equipment NH track skidloader 90.00 85.00 Bobcat 753 98.00 Cat287 trackloader 85.00 TR270 SkidSteer 85.00 NH566 Skidloader 35.00

95.00 Brillion Drill JD 4720 tractor 85.00 JCB Telehandler 40.00

70.00 BaleBuster Mulcher 103.00 JD 3720 tractor 85.00 Post hole attchmt 15.00

Grapple fk attchmt 10.00

** All hourly price quotes accepted.  Equipment use will be based on location of need, and availability of bidder.

Seasonal Requirements:   Equipment Rental

140.00/185.00

185.00/175.00

January 21, 2016

24" dbl drum sheepsfoot

Case TV380 skidloader

Case 270 skidloader

25.00/acre



Seasonal Requirements:  Weed Spraying
Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

DeAngelo Brothers, LLC

Albert Lea, MN

Price per Mile

Curtail Weed Spraying in Region 1 141.3 Miles (No spraying this year)

Florida, Hammer, Oshkosh,

Fortier, Norman, Wergeland Townships

Curtail Weed Spraying in Region 2 109.9 Miles (No spraying this year)

Omro, Tyro, Burton,

Swede Prairie Townships

Curtail Weed Spraying in Region 3 135.0 Miles (No spraying this year)

Lisbon, Stony Run, Friendship,

Hazel Run, Normania, Sandnes Townships

Curtail Weed Spraying in Region 4 115.7 Miles $150.00

Minnesota Falls, Wood Lake,

Sioux Agency, Posen, Echo Townships

*** Accepted bid of DeAngelo Brothers, LLC for Curtail weed spraying in Region 4

January 21, 2016



Seasonal Requirements:  Calcium Chloride Dust Control

Yellow Medicine County Highway Dept.

January 21, 2016

Item Description Price Amount Price Amount

Calcium Chloride Solution 36,000 Gal $1.128 $40,608.00 $1.145 $41,220.00

***   Accepted bid of EnviroTech Services for 38% liquid calcium chloride solution

EnviroTech Services

Greeley, COApproximate

Quantity

Tri-City Paving, Inc.

Little Falls, MN


